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Notice of Availability of Reports 
This agenda is a summary of the actions proposed to be taken by the City Council.  For almost every agenda item, 
materials have been prepared by the City staff for the Council's consideration.  These materials include staff reports 
which explain in detail the item before the Council and the reason for the recommendation.  The materials may also 
include resolutions or ordinances which are proposed to be adopted.  Other materials, such as maps and diagrams, 
may also be included.  All of these materials are available at the City Clerk's Office, located on the 3rd Floor of City 
Hall, 200 H Street, Antioch, CA  94509, during normal business hours for inspection and (for a fee) copying.  Copies 
are also made available at the Antioch Public Library for inspection.  Questions on these materials may be directed 
to the staff member who prepared them, or to the City Clerk's Office, who will refer you to the appropriate person. 
 

Notice of Opportunity to Address Council 
The public has the opportunity to address the Council on each agenda item.  To address the Council, fill out a yellow 
Speaker Request form, available on each side of the entrance doors, and place in the Speaker Card Tray.  See the 
Speakers' Rules on the inside cover of this Agenda.  Comments regarding matters not on this Agenda may be 
addressed during the "Public Comments" section. 
 
 
7:00 P.M. ROLL CALL – REGULAR MEETING – for Council Members – Council Members Tiscareno,  

Ogorchock and Mayor Wright (Council Members Wilson and Thorpe – Absent) 
 
 PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 
 
 1. PROCLAMATION 
 

 Bicentenary of the Birth of Baha’u’llah, October 22, 2017 
Approved, 3/0 

  Recommended Action: It is recommended that the City Council approve the proclamation. 
 

 
 ANNOUNCEMENTS OF CIVIC AND COMMUNITY EVENTS 
 
 ANNOUNCEMENTS OF BOARD AND COMMISSION OPENINGS 
 

 POLICE CRIME PREVENTION COMMISSION (Deadline date to apply:  10/13/17) 
 PLANNING COMMISSION (Deadline date to apply:  10/13/17) 

 
 PUBLIC COMMENTS – Members of the public may comment only on unagendized items. The public 

may comment on agendized items when they come up on this Agenda. 
 
 CITY COUNCIL COMMITTEE REPORTS 
 
 MAYOR’S COMMENTS 
 
 PRESENTATION – Antioch Library Update, presented by Liz Fuller, Senior Community Library 

Manager, Contra Costa County Library 
 
 

22..  CCOONNSSEENNTT  CCAALLEENNDDAARR  
 
 
 A. APPROVAL OF COUNCIL MINUTES FOR SEPTEMBER 26, 2017   

Approved, 3/0 
  Recommended Action: It is recommended that the City Council approve the minutes. 

PRESENTATION 

STAFF REPORT 

STAFF REPORT 
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  CCOONNSSEENNTT  CCAALLEENNDDAARR  ––  CCoonnttiinnuueedd    
 
 
 B. APPROVAL OF COUNCIL WARRANTS  

Approved, 3/0 
  Recommended Action: It is recommended that the City Council approve the warrants. 
 
 
 C. REJECTION OF CLAIM:  TROY KING 

Rejected, 3/0 
  Recommended Action: It is recommended that the City Council reject the claim of Troy King that 

was received on July 24, 2017. 
 
 
 D. APPROVAL OF TREASURER’S REPORT FOR AUGUST 2017  

Approved, 3/0 
  Recommended Action: It is recommended that the City Council approve the report. 
 
 
 E. CONSIDERATION OF BIDS FOR CITY WIDE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES (BID 485-0913-18A) 

Reso No. 2017/118 adopted, 3/0 
   Recommended Action: It is recommended that the City Council adopt a resolution awarding the City 

Wide Janitorial Supplies Bid to the lowest responsive and responsible 
bidder, Cole Supply Company, Inc. and authorize the City Manager to 
execute a purchase agreement in the amount of $75,000 per year from 
October 1, 2017 through June 30, 2020, for an amount not to exceed 
$225,000. 

 
 
 
 
 
  CCOOUUNNCCIILL  RREEGGUULLAARR  AAGGEENNDDAA  
  
  
 3. BOARD OF ADMINISTRATIVE APPEAL APPOINTMENT FOR ONE (1) PARTIAL-TERM VACANCY 

EXPIRING MARCH 2020 
Reso No. 2017/119 adopted appointing Farideh Faraji to the   

one partial-term vacancy, expiring March 2020, 3/0 
  Recommended Action: It is recommended that the Mayor nominate and Council appoint by 

resolution one (1) member to the Board of Administrative Appeals for a 
partial-term vacancy which will expire March 2020. 

 
 
 4. ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT COMMISSION APPOINTMENT FOR ONE (1) PARTIAL-TERM 

VACANCY EXPIRING JUNE 2019 
Reso No. 2017/120 adopted appointing Tracey Nicks to the   

one partial-term vacancy, expiring June 2019, 3/0 
  Recommended Action: It is recommended that the Mayor nominate and Council appoint by 

resolution one (1) partial-term vacancy to the Economic Development 
Commission expiring June 2019.  

 
 

STAFF REPORT 

STAFF REPORT 

STAFF REPORT 

STAFF REPORT 

STAFF REPORT 

STAFF REPORT 
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  CCOOUUNNCCIILL  RREEGGUULLAARR  AAGGEENNDDAA  ––  CCoonnttiinnuueedd   
  
  
 5.  PLANNING COMMISSION APPOINTMENT FOR THREE (3) FULL-TERM VACANCIES EXPIRING 

OCTOBER 2021 
Reso No. 2017/121 adopted appointing Janet Zacharatos, Martha Parsons, and  

Robert Martin to the three full-term vacancies, expiring October 2021, 3/0 
  Recommended Action: It is recommended that the Mayor nominate and Council appoint by 

adopting the resolution (3) three members to the Planning Commission for 3 
full-term vacancies expiring October 2021. 

  
  
 6. CONSIDERATION AND FINAL DETERMINATION OF BOARD OF ADMINISTRATIVE APPEALS 

DECISION REGARDING:  ANTIOCH MUNICIPAL CODE VIOLATIONS AT 701 WILBUR AVENUE, 
ANTIOCH, OWNED BY JOSEPH AND DEBRA BOSMAN (CE CASE CD1701-026) 

Council motioned to Uphold the Board of  
Administrative Appeals decision, 3/0 

  Recommended Action: It is recommended that the City Council uphold the Board of Administrative 
Appeals decision regarding the Notice of Violation issued to Joseph 
Bosman for violations of the Antioch Municipal Code. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  
 
 

 PUBLIC COMMENT 
 
 
 STAFF COMMUNICATIONS 
 
 
 COUNCIL COMMUNICATIONS AND FUTURE AGENDA ITEMS – Council Members report out 

various activities and any Council Member may place an item for 
discussion and direction on a future agenda.  Timing determined by 
Mayor and City Manager – no longer than 6 months. 

 
 
 ADJOURNMENT – 8:43 p.m. 

STAFF REPORT 

STAFF REPORT 



Antioch Library 

Update 



New Hours – July 1, 2017 

 

 

 Programs Offered 

August 2016: 13 

August 2017: 27 

108% increase 

 Program Attendance: 

August 2016: 191 

August 2017: 527 

176% increase 

 

Increased Usage 



Increased Usage 
 Library Cards 

 New Cards/Reregistrations, August 2016: 55/139 

 New Cards/Reregistrations, August 2017: 59/146 

 7%/5% increase 

 Computer Usage 

 August 2016: 1,056 hours  

 August 2017: 1,283 hours 

 22% increase 

 

 

 



Increased Usage 
 Lunch at the Library 

 2016: Offered 21 days, served 608 meals 

 2017: Offered 28 days, served 717 meals 

 33%/18% increase 

 Project Second Chance Tutor Sessions/Computer Lab Hours 

 August 2016: 31/11 

 August 2017: 36/55 

 16%/53% increase 

 



New Programs 
 

 ESL Conversation Group 
Wednesdays at 12:00 p.m. 

 

 Family Storytime  
Mondays at 6:00 p.m. 

 

 Preschool Storytime 
Wednesdays at 2:00 p.m. 

 
 



Free Music Series at the Antioch Library: October 2017 – May 2018 

Dave Rocha Jazz Group 

Durt Cheap - Country and Bluegrass  

Music Masters - Choral 

Drummm! - Percussion 

The Black Brothers - Celtic 

Big Band 

Divine Voices - Choral 

Keller Canyon Mitigation Fund Grant 





 

 

 
BICENTENARY OF THE BIRTH OF BAHA’U’LLAH 

OCTOBER 22, 2017 

 
WHEREAS, a crying need of humanity is the achievement of unity, peace and justice in 

our communities; and 
 

WHEREAS, in the nineteenth century, Baha’u’llah, the founder of the Baha’i Faith,  
brought a message of human dignity, capacity and oneness suited to the  

requirements of contemporary life, and October 22, 2017 marks the  
two-hundredth anniversary of the birth of Baha’u’llah; and 

 
WHEREAS, the City of Antioch, California is a microcosm of diverse racial and religious 

communities; and 
 

WHEREAS, since April 21, 1978, the Baha’i Assembly of Antioch has striven to apply this 
vision to the material and spiritual life of Antioch, collaborating with others to  

promote unity and to serve their fellow citizens; and 
 

WHEREAS, the Baha’is of Antioch and their families, friends, neighbors, and colleagues 
are commemorating this bicentenary, along with Baha’is across the United States  

and around the World. 
 

NOW, THEREFORE, I, SEAN WRIGHT, Mayor of the City of Antioch, 
do hereby declare Sunday, October 22nd, 2017, as the “BICENTENARY OF THE BIRTH 

OF BAHA’U’LLAH” in the City and urge all to resolve on this day:  to promote in  
themselves and in their relations with others those qualities and attributes  

that will help bring about the recognition of the oneness of humanity; 
to embrace diversity; and to work for unity in our Local  

Community, in our Country, and in the World. 

 
OCTOBER 10, 2017 

 
 

 
_________________________________ 

SEAN WRIGHT, Mayor 
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CITY COUNCIL MEETING 
INCLUDING THE ANTIOCH CITY COUNCIL  

ACTING AS HOUSING SUCCESSOR TO THE  
ANTIOCH DEVELOPMENT AGENCY 

 
 

Regular Meeting September 26, 2017 
7:00 P.M. Council Chambers 
 
 
Mayor Wright called the meeting to order at 7:04 P.M., and City Clerk Simonsen called the roll. 
 
Present: Council Members Wilson, Thorpe, Ogorchock and Mayor Wright 
Absent: Council Member Tiscareno 
 
PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE  
 
Councilmember Ogorchock led the Council and audience in the Pledge of Allegiance.  
 
ANNOUNCEMENTS OF CIVIC AND COMMUNITY EVENTS  
 
Betty Smith, Rivertown Jamboree, invited the community to attend the Jammin’ on the Delta Boat 
Show beginning at 10:00 A.M. on October 7 and 8, 2017 at the Antioch Marina.  She recognized 
and thanked everyone who sponsored the event. 
 
Lee Ballesteros, representing the Drama Factory, announced Monster Dash 5k and 1-mile Fun 
Run Fundraiser would be held at 8:00 A.M. on October 14, 2017 at Contra Loma Reservoir.  Flyers 
for the event were provided to Council, staff and in the back of Council Chambers.  
 
Melisa Margain and Alicia Hastings, representing Rubicon Programs, announced Girl Talk, a 
women’s support group, would be held 5:30 P.M. – 7:30 P.M. every Tuesday beginning October 3, 
2017 at 418 W. 4th Street.   
 
Councilmember Ogorchock announced Senior Resource Day would be held on September 29, 
2017 at the Senior Center.    
 
ANNOUNCEMENTS OF BOARD AND COMMISSION OPENINGS 
 
City Clerk Simonsen announced the following Board and Commission openings: 
 
 Police Crime Prevention Commission: Three Full-term (3) vacancies and One Partial-term 

vacancy; deadline date is October 13, 2017 
 Planning Commission: One Partial-term (1) vacancy; deadline date is October 13, 2017 

 
He reported applications would be available in Council Chambers, online at the City’s website and 
at the City Clerk’s and Deputy City Clerks offices.  
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PUBLIC COMMENTS 
 
Marty Fernandez, Antioch resident, expressed concern regarding Measure O and the delay in 
collection of business tax fees for rental properties.  He suggested the City turn the process over 
to the County Assessor’s office.   
 
COUNCIL SUBCOMMITTEE REPORTS 
 
Councilmember Wilson reported on her attendance at TRANSPLAN and Quality of Life Ad Hoc 
Committee Meetings.  She announced the East Contra Costa Regional Fee and Financing 
Authority (ECCRFFA) Meeting was cancelled due to the lack of a quorum. 
 
Councilmember Thorpe reported on his attendance at the Quality of Life Ad Hoc Committee and 
Delta Diablo Meetings. 
 
Councilmember Ogorchock reported on her attendance at the League of California Cities 
Meetings. 
 
Mayor Wright thanked Council for filling in for him while he was out of town. 
 
MAYOR’S COMMENTS 
 
Mayor Wright reported the City was looking at potentially submitting a bid for the Amazon project.  
He announced that he had represented the City in China for potential partnership and investment 
opportunities.  He noted interest was expressed in Antioch due to its close proximity to Silicon 
Valley.  He reported he followed up at a conference in Palo Alto where opportunities for economic 
growth in Antioch were discussed.   
 
PRESENTATION  
 
Mayor Wright announced City Clerk Simonsen received training and had been awarded the 
International Institute of Certified Municipal Clerk designation.    
 
The Council, City Manager Bernal, and Interim City Attorney Cole congratulated City Clerk 
Simonsen for his accomplishments and representing the City in a professional manner. 
 
City Clerk Simonsen thanked and congratulated Deputy City Clerk Garcia who graduated from 
Technical Training for Clerks.  He stated he was honored to follow in footsteps of the City’s prior 
Certified Municipal Clerks.  He discussed the duties and responsibilities of the City Clerk’s office.  
He suggested Council consider funding a full-time City Clerk position.  He thanked his wife and 
everyone who supported him.   
 
Council presented City Clerk Simonsen with a Certified Municipal Clerk certificate.   
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1. COUNCIL CONSENT CALENDAR ffoorr  CCiittyy  //CCiittyy  aass  SSuucccceessssoorr  AAggeennccyy//HHoouussiinngg  SSuucccceessssoorr  

ttoo  tthhee  AAnnttiioocchh  DDeevveellooppmmeenntt  AAggeennccyy 
 
A. APPROVAL OF COUNCIL MINUTES FOR AUGUST 22, 2017   
 
B. APPROVAL OF COUNCIL MINUTES FOR SEPTEMBER 12, 2017   
 
C. APPROVAL OF COUNCIL WARRANTS  
 
D. ORDINANCE 2129-C-S SECOND READING – ORDINANCE AMENDING BUILDING 

REGULATIONS FOR EXPEDITED, STREAMLINED PERMITTING PROCEDURES FOR 
ELECTRIC VEHICLE CHARGING STATIONS 

 
E. MASTER MUNICIPAL CLERK ACADEMY SERIES 101 
 
F. RESOLUTION NO. 2017/116 POLICE DEPARTMENT RANGE RETROFIT 
 
City of Antioch Acting as Housing Successor to the Antioch Development Agency  
 
G. APPROVAL OF HOUSING SUCCESSOR WARRANTS  
 
On motion by Councilmember Wilson, seconded by Councilmember Thorpe, the Council 
Members present unanimously approved the Council Consent Calendar. 
 
PUBLIC HEARING 
 
2. ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ANTIOCH ADDING SECTION 5 

TO CHAPTER 7 OF TITLE 5 OF THE ANTIOCH MUNICIPAL CODE PROHIBITING THE 
HOURLY RENTALS OF LODGING UNITS WITHIN CITY LIMITS  

 
City Manager Bernal introduced Public Hearing Item #2. 
 
Interim City Attorney Cole recommended the public hearing be continued to October 24, 2017. 
 
On motion by Councilmember Wilson, seconded by Councilmember Thorpe, the Council 
Members present unanimously continued the Public Hearing to October 24, 2017. 
 
COUNCIL REGULAR AGENDA  
 
3. ROAD MAINTENANCE AND REHABILITATION ACCOUNT (RMRA) 
 
Assistant City Engineer Filson presented the staff report dated September 26, 2017, 
recommending the City Council adopt a resolution amending the 2017-19 Budget to incorporate a 
list of projects funded by SB1 - The Road Repair and Accountability Act - and create a separate 
fund for the revenues and expenses. 
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Councilmember Ogorchock requested staff reconsider and add View Drive and Terranova Drive to 
the road repair projects.   
 
Mayor Wright discussed the importance of SB1 - The Road Repair and Accountability Act as a 
tool for funding road repair projects. 
 

RESOLUTION NO. 2017/117 
 
On motion by Councilmember Ogorchock, seconded by Councilmember Thorpe, the Council 
Members present unanimously adopted a resolution amending the 2017-19 Budget to incorporate 
a list of projects funded by SB1 - The Road Repair and Accountability Act - and create a separate 
fund for the revenues and expenses. 
 
PUBLIC COMMENTS - None 
 
STAFF COMMUNICATIONS - None 
 
COUNCIL COMMUNICATIONS 
 
Following discussion, Councilmember Ogorchock requested Council consider budgeting for a 
Records Management Program for the Clerk’s office. 
 
Councilmember Thorpe stated he would support those discussions occurring in the context of 
Mid-Year Budget review. 
 
ADJOURNMENT 
 
With no further business, Mayor Wright adjourned the meeting at 7:45 P.M. to the next regular 
Council meeting on October 10, 2017. 
 

Respectfully submitted: 
 
 

  Kitty Eiden  

KITTY EIDEN, Minutes Clerk 
 
 

 



CITY OF ANTIOCH

CLAIMS BY FUND REPORT

FOR THE PERIOD OF

SEPTEMBER 15 - SEPTEMBER 27, 2017

FUND/CHECK#

100 General Fund

Non Departmental

370907 ABRAMS ASSOCIATES CONSULTING SERVICES 7,699.00

370987 MICHAEL BAKER INTERNATIONAL INC CONSULTING SERVICES 1,391.25

City Attorney

371087 HEWLETT PACKARD COMPANY COMPUTER SUPPLIES 283.00

City Manager

370920 BANK OF AMERICA MEETING EXPENSE 122.17

370953 FEDERAL ADVOCATES INC CONSULTING SERVICES 4,166.67

371001 OFFICE MAX INC OFFICE SUPPLIES 367.06

371056 BERNAL JR, ROWLAND EXPENSE REIMBURSEMENT 240.01

City Clerk

371054 BAY AREA NEWS GROUP LEGAL AD 1,151.10

371123 SIMONSEN, ARNE EXPENSE REIMBURSEMENT 346.56

Human Resources

370955 FEDEX SHIPPING 15.00

370966 IEDA INC PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 4,191.59

370969 JACKSON LEWIS LLP PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 1,221.00

370977 LOPEZ, TAYLOR M EDUCATION REIMBURSEMENT 800.00

Economic Development

370920 BANK OF AMERICA EVENT EXPENSE 1,339.82

Finance Administration

371106 OFFICE MAX INC OFFICE SUPPLIES 61.40

Finance Operations

371033 UNITED PARCEL SERVICE WEEKLY PRINTER SERVICE FEE 15.90

371106 OFFICE MAX INC OFFICE SUPPLIES 266.55

Non Departmental

370916 ASSOCIATION OF BAY AREA GOVERN MEMBERSHIP DUES 21,858.00

370925 BLUE MOUNTAIN AIR INC BUS LIC TAX REFUND 525.00

370961 HEWLETT PACKARD COMPANY COMPUTER EQUIPMENT 837.79

370976 LEW EDGARDS GROUP, THE CONSULTING SERVICES 4,950.00

370992 MUNISERVICES LLC STARS QTR1 7,123.75

371014 ROMIS FOOD AND LIQUOR BUS LIC TAX REFUND 246.89

371041 ABLE HEARTH AND HOME INC BUS LIC TAX REFUND 289.25

371072 DELTA DIABLO AUGUST WATER 16,617.13

Public Works Maintenance Administration

371035 VERIZON WIRELESS DATA USAGE 38.01

Public Works Street Maintenance

370952 FASTENAL CO SUPPLIES 29.97

371010 RED WING SHOE STORE SAFETY SHOES - LLOYD 266.24

Page 1
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CITY OF ANTIOCH

CLAIMS BY FUND REPORT

FOR THE PERIOD OF

SEPTEMBER 15 - SEPTEMBER 27, 2017

FUND/CHECK#

371035 VERIZON WIRELESS DATA USAGE 38.01

371117 RED WING SHOE STORE SAFETY SHOES - NORTHAM 174.82

930074 GRAINGER INC SUPPLIES 57.76

Public Works-Signal/Street Lights

370918 AT AND T MCI PHONE 745.45

371007 PACIFIC GAS AND ELECTRIC CO ELECTRIC 190.18

930077 ICR ELECTRICAL CONTRACTORS ELECTRICAL SERVICES 3,773.67

930093 ICR ELECTRICAL CONTRACTORS ELECTRICAL SERVICES 5,961.59

Public Works-Striping/Signing

370979 LOWES COMPANIES INC SUPPLIES 111.82

370983 MANERI SIGN COMPANY SIGNS 354.10

371028 TAPCO PARTS 698.24

371035 VERIZON WIRELESS DATA USAGE 38.01

371045 ACE HARDWARE, ANTIOCH SUPPLIES 9.69

Public Works-Facilities Maintenance

370918 AT AND T MCI PHONE 58.98

370922 BANK OF AMERICA PARTS 335.92

370979 LOWES COMPANIES INC SUPPLIES 411.97

371009 REAL PROTECTION INC FIRE ALARM SYSTEM TEST 360.23

371035 VERIZON WIRELESS DATA USAGE 38.01

371042 ACME SECURITY SYSTEMS ALARM SERVICE 328.75

371053 BARTON, T ALAN EXPENSE REIMBURSEMENT 73.10

371075 DREAM RIDE ELEVATOR ELEVATOR SERVICE 160.00

371089 HONEYWELL INTERNATIONAL INC HVAC SERVICES 13,075.50

371105 OAKLEYS PEST CONTROL PEST CONTROL 165.00

371127 TYLER SHAW DOORS REPAIR SERVICES 200.00

930070 CDW GOVERNMENT INC COMPUTER SUPPLIES 3,527.81

930088 CDW GOVERNMENT INC COMPUTER SUPPLIES 1,880.33

930093 ICR ELECTRICAL CONTRACTORS ELECTRICAL SERVICES 864.00

Public Works-Parks Maint

370912 AMERICAN PLUMBING INC PLUMBING SERVICES 637.53

370918 AT AND T MCI PHONE 103.07

370994 MYERS CONTAINER LLC EQUIPMENT 4,672.01

371007 PACIFIC GAS AND ELECTRIC CO ELECTRIC 158.26

371044 AMERICAN PLUMBING INC PLUMBING SERVICES 523.73

930081 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES PACHECO SUPPLIES 1,135.76

930093 ICR ELECTRICAL CONTRACTORS ELECTRICAL SERVICES 5,315.53

930099 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES PACHECO SUPPLIES 1,860.44

Public Works-Median/General Land

370918 AT AND T MCI PHONE 215.95

Page 2
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CITY OF ANTIOCH

CLAIMS BY FUND REPORT

FOR THE PERIOD OF

SEPTEMBER 15 - SEPTEMBER 27, 2017

FUND/CHECK#

370963 HORIZON SUPPLIES 373.34

370979 LOWES COMPANIES INC SUPPLIES 12.39

371007 PACIFIC GAS AND ELECTRIC CO ELECTRIC 59.83

371015 RON TONKIN IRRIGATION REPAIR SERVICES 305.00

371045 ACE HARDWARE, ANTIOCH SUPPLIES 23.94

930081 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES PACHECO SUPPLIES 340.97

930099 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES PACHECO REPAIR SERVICES 2,545.71

Public Works-Work Alternative

370958 FURBER SAW INC FILTERS 74.84

Police Administration

370908 ADAMSON POLICE PRODUCTS EQUIPMENT 119.46

370915 ARROWHEAD 24 HOUR TOWING INC TOWING SERVICES 814.50

370928 CHALK, STEPHANIE A TRAINING PER DIEM 34.50

370930 COMMERCIAL SUPPORT SERVICES CAR WASHES 399.00

370931 CONCORD UNIFORMS LLC NAME TAGS 35.72

370932 CONTRA COSTA COUNTY RANGE FEES 195.00

370935 CCC POLICE CHIEFS ASSOC FY 17/18 ANNUAL DUES 775.00

370936 CORTEZ, ANA E EXPENSE REIMBURSEMENT 98.23

370937 COSTCO MEETING EXPENSE 363.54

370938 COSTCO PHOTO PROCESSING 257.40

370955 FEDEX SHIPPING 31.65

370975 LC ACTION POLICE SUPPLY SUPPLIES 701.37

370996 NET TRANSCRIPTS TRANSCRIPTION SERVICES 351.76

371000 OFFICE MAX INC OFFICE SUPPLIES 333.52

371001 OFFICE MAX INC OFFICE SUPPLIES 1,359.49

371024 SIMPSON INVESTIGATIVE SERVICES PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 812.30

371026 STATE OF CALIFORNIA DOJ FEES 337.00

371043 ALL PRO PRINTING SOLUTIONS PRINTING SERVICES 392.77

371050 BANK OF AMERICA RECRUITMENT 4,803.16

371051 BANK OF AMERICA MEETING EXPENSE 2,138.90

371052 BANK OF AMERICA MEETING EXPENSE 437.30

371106 OFFICE MAX INC OFFICE SUPPLIES 194.24

371108 CARDIAC SCIENCE CORP AED REPLACEMENTS 4,698.00

930078 IMAGE SALES INC ID CARDS 60.53

930079 MOBILE MINI LLC EVIDENCE STORAGE 250.14

Police Community Policing

370937 COSTCO FUEL 75.99

370990 MOORE K9 SERVICES K9 TRAINING 800.00

370999 OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH CENTERS OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 303.65

371124 SP PLUS CORPORATION PARKING ENFORCEMENT 12,875.00
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CITY OF ANTIOCH

CLAIMS BY FUND REPORT

FOR THE PERIOD OF

SEPTEMBER 15 - SEPTEMBER 27, 2017

FUND/CHECK#

Police Investigations

370937 COSTCO MEETING EXPENSE 151.24

370960 HAWK ANALYTICS EVIDENCE ANALYSIS 4,995.00

370984 MC MANUS, ERIC A EXPENSE REIMBURSEMENT 36.94

371031 TRANSUNION RISK & ALTERNATIVES DATA USAGE 15.20

371050 BANK OF AMERICA SUPPLIES 137.96

371051 BANK OF AMERICA PRINTER 129.88

371064 CONCORD UNIFORMS LLC UNIFORMS 424.94

371100 MC MANUS, ERIC A EXPENSE REIMBURSEMENT 93.27

930072 CRYSTAL CLEAR LOGOS INC BADGES 348.00

Police Special Operations Unit

370938 COSTCO INVESTIGATIONS SUPPLIES 1,218.73

371030 TOYOTA FINANCIAL SERVICES VEHICLE LEASE 1,174.70

371126 TOYOTA FINANCIAL SERVICES VEHICLE LEASE 442.97

Police Communications

370918 AT AND T MCI PHONE 814.84

371049 AT AND T MCI PHONE 105.52

371061 COMCAST CONNECTION SERVICES 375.17

371062 COMCAST CONNECTION SERVICES 105.55

371068 CONTRA COSTA COUNTY RADIO SERVICES 256.00

371069 CONTRA COSTA COUNTY RADIO SERVICES 64.00

371113 PACIFIC TELEMANAGEMENT SERVICE LOBBY PHONE 78.00

371130 VERIZON WIRELESS DATA USAGE 2,204.58

Office Of Emergency Management

370918 AT AND T MCI PHONE 307.84

Police Community Volunteers

371064 CONCORD UNIFORMS LLC UNIFORMS 48.88

371098 LEVOC CONFERENCE FEE 840.00

Police Facilities Maintenance

370918 AT AND T MCI PHONE 294.83

370922 BANK OF AMERICA SUPPLIES 55.25

370979 LOWES COMPANIES INC SUPPLIES 175.74

370981 M AND L OVERHEAD DOORS REPAIR SERVICES 248.72

371009 REAL PROTECTION INC FIRE ALARM SYSTEM TEST 311.38

371052 BANK OF AMERICA SUPPLIES 421.37

371071 DELL COMPUTERS SERVER 8,526.38

371089 HONEYWELL INTERNATIONAL INC HVAC SERVICES 7,233.00

Community Development Land Planning Services

371054 BAY AREA NEWS GROUP LEGAL AD 118.80

371079 EIDEN, KITTY J MINUTES CLERK 168.00
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CITY OF ANTIOCH

CLAIMS BY FUND REPORT

FOR THE PERIOD OF

SEPTEMBER 15 - SEPTEMBER 27, 2017

FUND/CHECK#

CD Code Enforcement

370934 CONTRA COSTA COUNTY RECORDING FEES 595.00

370941 DELTA FENCE CO RENTAL FEE 410.13

370973 K2GC ABATEMENT SERVICE 785.84

371106 OFFICE MAX INC OFFICE SUPPLIES 73.90

930072 CRYSTAL CLEAR LOGOS INC UNIFORMS 266.22

PW Engineer Land Development

370918 AT AND T MCI PHONE 37.89

370970 JN ENGINEERING INSPECTION SERVICES 18,050.00

371035 VERIZON WIRELESS ELECTRIC 76.02

371048 ARC ALTERNATIVES PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 6,529.61

Community Development Building Inspection

370945 EAGLE BUSINESS FORMS INC BUILDING PERMITS 411.16

371106 OFFICE MAX INC OFFICE SUPPLIES 367.28

Capital Imp. Administration

371035 VERIZON WIRELESS DATA USAGE 38.01

212 CDBG Fund

CDBG

371054 BAY AREA NEWS GROUP LEGAL AD 118.80

930076 HOUSE, TERI CONSULTING SERVICES 9,717.50

213 Gas Tax Fund

Streets

371007 PACIFIC GAS AND ELECTRIC CO ELECTRIC 82.78

214 Animal Control Fund

Animal Control

370947 EAST BAY VETERINARY EMERGENCY VETERINARY SERVICES 71.76

370948 EAST HILLS VETERINARY HOSPITAL VETERINARY SERVICES 1,456.60

370961 HEWLETT PACKARD COMPANY COMPUTER SUPPLIES 837.79

370993 MWI VETERINARY SUPPLY CO MEDICAL SUPPLIES 1,549.79

371025 STARLINE SUPPLY COMPANY SUPPLIES 30.62

371055 BAYER HEALTH CARE MEDICAL SUPPLIES 86.83

371078 EAST HILLS VETERINARY HOSPITAL VETERINARY SERVICES 4,650.20

371086 HARO, SUSAN D EXPENSE REIMBURSEMENT 82.08

371088 HILLS PET NUTRITION ANIMAL FOOD 767.54

371104 MWI VETERINARY SUPPLY CO MEDICAL SUPPLIES 80.62

215 Civic Arts Fund

Civic Arts

371009 REAL PROTECTION INC FIRE ALARM SYSTEM TEST 67.60
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CITY OF ANTIOCH

CLAIMS BY FUND REPORT

FOR THE PERIOD OF

SEPTEMBER 15 - SEPTEMBER 27, 2017

FUND/CHECK#

219 Recreation Fund

Non Departmental

370910 AGUAYO, NORA DEPOSIT REFUND 1,000.00

370964 HUB INTERNATIONAL OF CA INSURA FACILITY INSURANCE 503.92

371022 SILVA HERNANDEZ, JERONIMO DEPOSIT REFUND 1,000.00

371073 DELTA YOUTH SOCCER DEPOSIT REFUND 500.00

Recreation Admin

370929 COLE SUPPLY CO INC SUPPLIES 300.69

370998 OAKLEYS PEST CONTROL PEST CONTROL 225.00

371009 REAL PROTECTION INC FIRE ALARM SYSTEM TEST 499.64

Senior Programs

370912 AMERICAN PLUMBING INC PLUMBING SERVICES 250.00

370918 AT AND T MCI PHONE 102.41

371089 HONEYWELL INTERNATIONAL INC HVAC SERVICES 5,406.25

Recreation Sports Programs

370918 AT AND T MCI PHONE 19.90

370921 BANK OF AMERICA EQUIPMENT 2,865.00

370998 OAKLEYS PEST CONTROL PEST CONTROL 150.00

371097 KIDZ LOVE SOCCER INC PROGRAM SERVICES 3,300.00

Recreation-New Comm Cntr

370917 AT AND T MCI PHONE 65.90

370918 AT AND T MCI PHONE 24.15

370921 BANK OF AMERICA EVENT EXPENSE 4,136.02

370923 BAY CITIES PYROTECTOR SPRINKLER INSPECTION 1,110.00

370927 CALIF DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE FINGERPRINTING 32.00

370929 COLE SUPPLY CO INC SUPPLIES 316.09

370939 COSTCO SUPPLIES 213.05

370943 DIABLO LIVE SCAN FINGERPRINTING 20.00

370944 DUGAND, KARINA CONTRACTOR PAYMENT 2,797.20

370972 JUMP BUNCH CONTRACTOR PAYMENT 324.00

370979 LOWES COMPANIES INC SUPPLIES 255.56

370998 OAKLEYS PEST CONTROL PEST CONTROL SERVICE 250.00

371011 RIDLEY, DEXTER CONTRACTOR PAYMENT 168.00

371022 SILVA HERNANDEZ, JERONIMO PERMIT REFUND 18.00

371058 CAL ACOUSTIC INTERIORS INC SUPPLIES 215.00

371089 HONEYWELL INTERNATIONAL INC HVAC SERVICES 9,930.25

930075 HAMMONS SUPPLY COMPANY SUPPLIES 273.33

222 Measure C/J Fund

Streets

371065 CONTRA COSTA COUNTY TRANSPLAN DUES 2,494.93
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CITY OF ANTIOCH

CLAIMS BY FUND REPORT

FOR THE PERIOD OF

SEPTEMBER 15 - SEPTEMBER 27, 2017

FUND/CHECK#

229 Pollution Elimination Fund

Channel Maintenance Operation

370989 MJH EXCAVATING INC EQUIPMENT RENTAL 4,115.00

371006 PACIFIC COAST LANDSCAPE MGMT INC LANDSCAPE SERVICES 2,800.50

371039 WRECO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 910.00

371082 FURBER SAW INC EQUIPMENT 249.66

371101 MJH EXCAVATING INC EQUIPMENT RENTAL 6,305.00

371112 PACIFIC COAST LANDSCAPE MGMT INC LANDSCAPE SERVICES 2,240.40

371119 RMC WATER AND ENVIRONMENT CONSULTING SERVICES 52.50

Storm Drain Administration

370933 CONTRA COSTA COUNTY JEPA AGENCY SHARE FY 16/17 21,994.47

251 Lone Tree SLLMD Fund

Lonetree Maintenance Zone 1

370918 AT AND T MCI PHONE 79.60

Lonetree Maintenance Zone 2

370918 AT AND T MCI PHONE 141.44

Lonetree Maintenance Zone 3

370918 AT AND T MCI PHONE 63.27

371023 SILVA LANDSCAPE LANDSCAPE SERVICES 5,575.36

371122 SILVA LANDSCAPE LANDSCAPE SERVICES 2,389.44

Lonetree Maintenance Zone 4

371023 SILVA LANDSCAPE LANDSCAPE SERVICES 6,156.00

371122 SILVA LANDSCAPE LANDSCAPE SERVICES 684.00

252 Downtown SLLMD Fund

Downtown Maintenance

370962 HOME DEPOT, THE SUPPLIES 130.07

370979 LOWES COMPANIES INC SUPPLIES 160.21

930099 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES PACHECO REPAIR SERVICES 539.75

254 Hillcrest SLLMD Fund

Hillcrest Maintenance Zone 1

370918 AT AND T MCI PHONE 39.80

371006 PACIFIC COAST LANDSCAPE MGMT INC LANDSCAPE SERVICES 4,667.50

371112 PACIFIC COAST LANDSCAPE MGMT INC LANDSCAPE SERVICES 3,360.56

371122 SILVA LANDSCAPE LANDSCAPE SERVICES 1,592.96

Hillcrest Maintenance Zone 2

370918 AT AND T MCI PHONE 144.06

371006 PACIFIC COAST LANDSCAPE MGMT INC LANDSCAPE SERVICES 2,800.50

371112 PACIFIC COAST LANDSCAPE MGMT INC LANDSCAPE SERVICES 2,053.68

Hillcrest Maintenance Zone 4

370918 AT AND T MCI PHONE 122.26
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CITY OF ANTIOCH

CLAIMS BY FUND REPORT

FOR THE PERIOD OF

SEPTEMBER 15 - SEPTEMBER 27, 2017

FUND/CHECK#

371023 SILVA LANDSCAPE LANDSCAPE SERVICES 1,592.96

255 Park 1A Maintenance District Fund

Park 1A Maintenance District

370918 AT AND T MCI PHONE 19.90

256 Citywide 2A Maintenance District Fund

Citywide 2A Maintenance Zone 9

370918 AT AND T MCI PHONE 82.03

Citywide 2A Maintenance Zone10

371122 SILVA LANDSCAPE LANDSCAPE SERVICES 2,736.00

257 SLLMD Administration Fund

SLLMD Administration

370922 BANK OF AMERICA SUPPLIES 495.28

371035 VERIZON WIRELESS DATA USAGE 76.02

311 Capital Improvement Fund

Parks & Open Space

371119 RMC WATER AND ENVIRONMENT CONSULTING SERVICES 6,529.00

376 Lone Diamond Fund

Assessment District

371060 CENTRAL SELF STORAGE ANTIOCH STORAGE FEE 229.00

570 Equipment Maintenance Fund

Non Departmental

370965 HUNT AND SONS INC FUEL 21,264.82

371091 HUNT AND SONS INC FUEL 295.50

Equipment Maintenance

370909 AFFORDABLE TIRE CENTER AUTO SERVICE 69.95

370915 ARROWHEAD 24 HOUR TOWING INC TOWING SERVICES 142.50

370922 BANK OF AMERICA MEMBERSHIP FEE 601.63

370924 BILL BRANDT FORD AUTO PARTS 192.31

370942 DIABLO INDUSTRIAL TOOL CO INC EQUIPMENT SERVICE 1,078.32

370946 EAST BAY TIRE CO TIRE SERVICE 106.31

370951 FAST UNDERCAR AUTO PARTS 94.00

370952 FASTENAL CO SMALL PARTS 16.52

370979 LOWES COMPANIES INC SUPPLIES 238.34

370982 MAACO ACCIDENT REPAIR 4,477.07

371003 OREILLY AUTO PARTS AUTO PARTS 14.13

371016 ROYAL BRASS INC REPAIR SERVICES 274.57

371020 SCELZI ENTERPRISES INC AUTO PARTS 823.01

371032 TRED SHED, THE TIRES 3,125.08

371035 VERIZON WIRELESS DATA USAGE 38.01

371036 WALNUT CREEK FORD AUTO PARTS 172.18
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CITY OF ANTIOCH

CLAIMS BY FUND REPORT

FOR THE PERIOD OF

SEPTEMBER 15 - SEPTEMBER 27, 2017

FUND/CHECK#

371037 WESTERN TRUCK FAB EQUIPMENT PARTS 3,288.89

371038 WINTER CHEVROLET CO AUTO PARTS 62.35

371046 ANTIOCH AUTO PARTS AUTO PARTS 2,023.78

371047 ANTIOCH GLASS AUTO GLASS SERVICE 299.00

371076 EAST BAY TIRE CO TIRE SERVICE 218.93

371081 FIRST CHOICE UPHOLSTERY AUTO SERVICES 435.00

371082 FURBER SAW INC PARTS 278.43

371085 HARLEY DAVIDSON AUTO PARTS 151.50

371096 KEN KELLER SALES EQUIPMENT PARTS 1,144.62

371102 MUNICIPAL MAINT EQUIPMENT INC PARTS 512.10

371116 PETERSON PARTS 119.86

371131 WALNUT CREEK FORD AUTO PARTS 340.47

930073 FREDS WELDING WELDING SERVICE 550.00

930074 GRAINGER INC SUPPLIES 71.85

930082 A1 TRANSMISSION AUTO SERVICE 1,825.51

930087 BIG SKY ENTERPRISES INC USED TIRE RECYCLE 739.50

930094 KIMBALL MIDWEST SHOP SUPPLIES 413.72

573 Information Services Fund

Information Services

370918 AT AND T MCI PHONE 71.99

371035 VERIZON WIRELESS DATA USAGE 338.99

Network Support & PCs

370918 AT AND T MCI PHONE 43.95

370997 NEW HORIZONS SERVER 2,975.00

930070 CDW GOVERNMENT INC SUPPORT SERVICES 4,674.00

Telephone System

370917 AT AND T MCI PHONE 353.08

370918 AT AND T MCI PHONE 1,454.31

GIS Support Services

371083 GIS PLANNING INC WEB HOSTING 1,000.00

371115 PETERS, BRANDON W L EXPENSE REIMBURSEMENT 2,556.30

Office Equipment Replacement

930090 COMPUTERLAND COMPUTER SUPPLIES 317.70

611 Water Fund

Non Departmental

370952 FASTENAL CO SUPPLIES 678.29

371012 ROBERTS AND BRUNE CO PIPE FITTINGS 1,357.20

371080 FASTENAL CO SUPPLIES 1,359.51

371111 PACE SUPPLY CORP SUPPLIES 771.04

930074 GRAINGER INC SUPPLIES 547.57
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CITY OF ANTIOCH

CLAIMS BY FUND REPORT

FOR THE PERIOD OF

SEPTEMBER 15 - SEPTEMBER 27, 2017

FUND/CHECK#

930075 HAMMONS SUPPLY COMPANY SUPPLIES 348.57

Water Supervision

370967 INFOSEND INC WATER BILL INSERT FEE 271.44

371002 ONLINE RESOURCES CHECK REIMBURSEMENT 240.00

371017 RT LAWRENCE CORP CHECK REIMBURSEMENT 4,693.30

371035 VERIZON WIRELESS DATA USAGE 76.02

Water Production

370911 ALTA FENCE REPAIR SERVICES 855.00

370917 AT AND T MCI PHONE 131.84

370918 AT AND T MCI PHONE 943.62

370920 BANK OF AMERICA SUPPLIES 28.00

370927 CALIF DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE FINGERPRINTING 49.00

370952 FASTENAL CO SUPPLIES 122.21

370957 FISHER SCIENTIFIC COMPANY LAB SUPPLIES 535.74

370974 LAW OFFICE OF MATTHEW EMRICK LEGAL SERVICES 17,853.00

370979 LOWES COMPANIES INC SUPPLIES 94.51

370986 MEDORA CORP SOLAR SERVICES 13,045.00

371007 PACIFIC GAS AND ELECTRIC CO ELECTRIC 209.93

371008 POLYDYNE INC POLYMER 2,530.00

371012 ROBERTS AND BRUNE CO PIPE FITTINGS 1,849.84

371018 S AND S SUPPLIES AND SOLUTIONS TESTING 650.00

371029 TARGET SPECIALTY PRODUCTS CUTRINE 3,752.90

371034 UNIVAR USA INC CAUSTIC 19,075.04

371035 VERIZON WIRELESS DATA USAGE 38.01

371045 ACE HARDWARE, ANTIOCH SUPPLIES 30.43

371070 CONTRA COSTA WATER DISTRICT PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 938,282.18

371084 GUALCO GROUP INC, THE PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 6,002.45

371091 HUNT AND SONS INC FUEL 257.80

371116 PETERSON MAINTENANCE SERVICES 3,960.44

371129 USA BLUE BOOK SUPPLIES 182.00

371132 WALTER BISHOP CONSULTING CONSULTING SERVICES 4,172.35

930071 CHEMTRADE CHEMICALS US LLC ALUM 8,257.35

930074 GRAINGER INC SUPPLIES 1,226.06

930080 SIERRA CHEMICAL CO CHLORINE 9,474.20

930083 AIRGAS SPECIALTY PRODUCTS AMMONIA 3,239.35

930089 CHEMTRADE CHEMICALS US LLC ALUM 21,890.29

930091 FREDS WELDING WELDING SERVICES 480.00

930092 GRAINGER INC SUPPLIES 14.87

930096 OLIN CHLOR ALKALI PRODUCTS CAUSTIC 14,224.08

930098 SIERRA CHEMICAL CO CHLORINE 5,045.78
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CITY OF ANTIOCH

CLAIMS BY FUND REPORT

FOR THE PERIOD OF

SEPTEMBER 15 - SEPTEMBER 27, 2017

FUND/CHECK#

Water Distribution

370913 ACE HARDWARE, ANTIOCH SUPPLIES 18.10

370914 ANTIOCH AUTO PARTS AUTO PARTS 31.41

370918 AT AND T MCI PHONE 39.20

370919 BACKFLOW DISTRIBUTORS INC PARTS 3,958.95

370922 BANK OF AMERICA TRAINING FEE 999.32

370950 EXPRESS SERVICES TEMP SERVICES 750.00

370958 FURBER SAW INC SUPPLIES 848.18

370967 INFOSEND INC POSTAGE FEES 3,923.81

370979 LOWES COMPANIES INC SUPPLIES 552.49

371004 PAC MACHINE CO INC PARTS 1,022.96

371012 ROBERTS AND BRUNE CO PIPE FITTINGS 81.97

371019 SAM CLAR OFFICE FURNITURE OFFICE FURNITURE 3,615.88

371027 SYAR INDUSTRIES INC ASPHALT 2,034.51

371035 VERIZON WIRELESS DATA USAGE 380.10

371090 HORIZON PARTS 14.44

371093 INFOSEND INC POSTAGE FEES 961.54

371117 RED WING SHOE STORE SAFETY SHOES - E PADILLA 265.44

371120 RT LAWRENCE CORP LOCKBOX SERVICES 549.14

371121 SEAMAN, JOHN M EXPENSE REIMBURSEMENT 73.00

930074 GRAINGER INC SUPPLIES 280.40

Water Meter Reading

370979 LOWES COMPANIES INC SUPPLIES 15.46

370995 NATIONAL METER & AUTOMATION INC WATER METER/PARTS 7,980.57

371035 VERIZON WIRELESS DATA USAGE 38.01

Public Buildings & Facilities

370954 FEDEX SHIPPING 29.66

370991 MUNICIPAL FINANCIAL SERVICES PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 3,780.00

371054 BAY AREA NEWS GROUP LEGAL AD 159.30

371057 BROWN AND CALDWELL INC CONSULTING SERVICES 1,533.00

371059 CAMP DRESSER AND MCKEE INC CONSULTING SERVICES 19,199.13

371118 RJ GORDON CONSTRUCTION INC PIPELINE PROJECT 21,046.96

371133 WEST YOST ASSOCIATES INC CONSULTING SERVICES 4,777.50

Warehouse & Central Stores

371033 UNITED PARCEL SERVICE WEEKLY PRINTER SERVICE FEE 15.90

621 Sewer Fund

Sewer-Wastewater Supervision

370949 EBMUD MEMBERSHIP FEE 2,361.00

371035 VERIZON WIRELESS DATA USAGE 76.02

371120 RT LAWRENCE CORP LOCKBOX SERVICES 549.13
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FUND/CHECK#

Sewer-Wastewater Collection

370918 AT AND T MCI PHONE 83.02

370922 BANK OF AMERICA MEDICAL EXAM 1,167.44

370940 CWEA SFBS RENEWAL FEE 370.00

370950 EXPRESS SERVICES TEMP SERVICES 750.00

370956 FERNANDEZ LOPEZ, KIM ANGEL RENEWAL FEE REIMBURSEMENT 180.00

370959 GOLDEN BELL PRODUCTS INC PEST CONTROL 28,984.20

370967 INFOSEND INC POSTAGE FEES 3,923.81

370968 INFRASTRUCTURE TECHNOLOGIES LLC PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 2,550.00

370991 MUNICIPAL FINANCIAL SERVICES PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 3,780.00

371005 PACHECO, ALVARO RAMIREZ CADL FEE REIMBURSEMENT 73.00

371012 ROBERTS AND BRUNE CO PIPE FITTINGS 3,345.82

371013 ROMANO, THEODORE CONRAD CWEA FEE REIMBURSEMENT 160.00

371016 ROYAL BRASS INC SUPPLIES 68.21

371027 SYAR INDUSTRIES INC ASPHALT 2,034.50

371035 VERIZON WIRELESS DATA USAGE 228.06

371080 FASTENAL CO SUPPLIES 309.48

371093 INFOSEND INC POSTAGE FEES 961.55

930097 SCOTTO, CHARLES W AND DONNA F PROPERTY LEASE 4,750.00

Wastewater Collection

370906 A S PIPELINES INC SANITARY SEWER PROJECT 222,041.60

370970 JN ENGINEERING INSPECTION SERVICES 900.00

631 Marina Fund

Marina Administration

370979 LOWES COMPANIES INC SUPPLIES 36.09

371009 REAL PROTECTION INC FIRE ALARM SYSTEM TEST 65.62

371054 BAY AREA NEWS GROUP LEGAL AD 71.10

371106 OFFICE MAX INC OFFICE SUPPLIES 76.42

Marina Maintenance

370952 FASTENAL CO SUPPLIES 565.64

370979 LOWES COMPANIES INC SUPPLIES 139.80

Major Projects

370922 BANK OF AMERICA SIGNS 482.47

641 Prewett Water Park Fund

Non Departmental

370926 BRADLEY, KEOCHIA DEPOSIT REFUND 1,000.00

370964 HUB INTERNATIONAL OF CA INSURANCE RENTAL INSURANCE 414.06

370971 JONES, LASHARN DEPOSIT REFUND 500.00

Recreation Water Park

370912 AMERICAN PLUMBING INC PLUMBING SERVICES 281.25
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CITY OF ANTIOCH
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SEPTEMBER 15 - SEPTEMBER 27, 2017

FUND/CHECK#

370918 AT AND T MCI PHONE 119.71

370923 BAY CITIES PYROTECTOR SPRINKLER INSPECTION 1,015.00

370929 COLE SUPPLY CO INC EQUIPMENT 3,981.67

370939 COSTCO EQUIPMENT 270.97

370979 LOWES COMPANIES INC SUPPLIES 346.11

370998 OAKLEYS PEST CONTROL PEST CONTROL 200.00

371009 REAL PROTECTION INC FIRE ALARM SYSTEM TEST 196.87

371021 SHADE STRUCTURES REPAIR SERVICES 2,028.07

371063 COMMERCIAL POOL SYSTEMS INC SUPPLIES 1,518.53

371067 CONTRA COSTA COUNTY PUBLIC SAFETY PROGRAM 1,350.00

371089 HONEYWELL INTERNATIONAL INC HVAC SERVICES 2,389.00

371128 UNIVAR USA INC CHEMICALS 1,364.82

721 Employee Benefits Fund

Non Departmental

371040 24 HOUR FITNESS SPORT PAYROLL DEDUCTIONS 74.98

371066 CONTRA COSTA COUNTY PAYROLL DEDUCTIONS 400.00

371074 DIAMOND HILLS SPORT CLUB PAYROLL DEDUCTIONS 183.00

371077 EAST COUNTY STRENGTH AND CONDI PAYROLL DEDUCTIONS 85.00

371092 IN SHAPE HEALTH CLUBS PAYROLL DEDUCTIONS 849.98

371094 INTERNAL REVENUE SERVICE PAYROLL DEDUCTIONS 60.00

371095 IRVIN DEUTSCHER YMCA PAYROLL DEDUCTIONS 50.00

371099 LINA PAYROLL DEDUCTIONS 6,112.63

371103 MUNICIPAL POOLING AUTHORITY PAYROLL DEDUCTIONS 3,675.92

371107 OLYMPIC HEALTH CLUB PAYROLL DEDUCTIONS 25.00

371109 OPERATING ENGINEERS LOCAL NO 3 PAYROLL DEDUCTIONS 2,851.00

371110 OPERATING ENGINEERS TRUST FUND PAYROLL DEDUCTIONS 15,690.95

371114 PARS PAYROLL DEDUCTIONS 3,575.14

371125 STANDARD LIFE INSURANCE PAYROLL DEDUCTIONS 798.25

930084 ANTIOCH PD SWORN MGMT ASSOC PAYROLL DEDUCTIONS 648.55

930085 ANTIOCH POLICE OFFICERS ASSOCI PAYROLL DEDUCTIONS 19,778.55

930086 ANTIOCH PUBLIC WORKS EMPLOYEE' PAYROLL DEDUCTIONS 3,740.63

930095 NATIONWIDE RETIREMENT SOLUTION PAYROLL DEDUCTIONS 61,534.37

930100 VANTAGEPOINT TRANSFER AGENTS 3 PAYROLL DEDUCTIONS 4,888.58
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STAFF REPORT TO THE CITY COUNCIL 

 
 
 
DATE:  Regular Meeting of October 10, 2017 
 
TO:   Honorable Mayor and Members of the City Council 
 
SUBMITTED BY: Elizabeth Perez, Interim Asst. City Attorney 
 
SUBJECT: Rejection of Claim:  Troy King 
 
 

 

RECOMMENDED ACTION 
It is recommended that the City Council reject the claim of Troy King that was received 
on July 24, 2017. 
 
Should the City Council desire to discuss this matter, it would be scheduled for a future 
closed session. 
 
 



STAFF REPORT TO THE CITY COUNCIL 
FOR CONSIDERA TION A T THE COUNCIL MEETING OF OCTOBER 1 O, 2017

SUBMITTED BY: Donna Conley, City Treasurer �

DATE October 4, 2017

SUBJECT: Treasurer's Rep01i-AUGUST 2017-

RECOMMENDATION: Review and file.

___2D___
10-10-17
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Agenda Item # 

  

 
STAFF REPORT TO THE CITY COUNCIL 

 
 
 
DATE:  Regular Meeting of October 10, 2017 
 
TO:   Honorable Mayor and Members of the City Council 
 
SUBMITTED BY: Justin Pitcher, Aquatic Maintenance Worker II 

Jeff Glover, Warehouse Maintenance Worker II 
 
APPROVED BY: Nancy Kaiser, Parks and Recreation Director  

Mike Bechtholdt, Deputy Public Works Director II 
 
SUBJECT: Consideration of Bids for City Wide Janitorial Supplies  
 

 
RECOMMENDED ACTION 
It is recommended that the City Council adopt a resolution awarding the City Wide 
Janitorial Supplies Bid  to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder, Cole Supply 
Company, Inc. and authorize the City Manager to execute a purchase agreement in the 
amount of $75,000.00 per year from October 1, 2017 through June 30, 2020 for an 
amount not to exceed $225,000.00 
  
STRATEGIC PURPOSE 
Long Term Goal J:  Parks and Recreation.  Provide outstanding facilities and 
programs for the community. 

- Strategy J-1:  Increase the use of the City’s recreation facilities 

 
Long Term Goal K:  Public Works & Engineering.  Designing, building, operating, 
maintaining, stewarding and enhancing Antioch’s assets and resources in partnership 
with the community. 

- Strategy K-1:  Ensure well maintained public facilities, rights-of-ways and parks. 

 
FISCAL IMPACT 
The 2017-2018 Budget includes funding for these materials and supplies and has been 
allocated within the Central Stores Inventory Fund.  There are no impacts to the 
approved budgets.    
 
DISCUSSION 
The Recreation and Public Works Departments published the City Wide Janitorial 
Supplies request for bids on August 29, 2017; the bid closed on September 13, 2017.  A 
citywide notice was issued and Bids were solicited from five suppliers. The City received 
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four complete and qualified submittals as shown on the attached bid tabulation.  Cole 
Supply Company, Inc. submitted the overall lowest bid.   
 
On September 13, 2017, four (4) bids were received and opened, as shown on the 
attached tabulation. The overall low bid was submitted by Cole Supply Company, Inc. 
The bids have been checked and found to be without any errors or omissions.  
 
The basic janitorial supplies noted in this bidding process include but are not limited to, 
restroom paper products, trash receptacle liners, general purpose and disinfecting 
cleaning chemicals, floor refinishing supplies, hand soap and graffiti remover.  City 
purchasing policies were followed and staff met the minimum requirements of public 
purchasing compliance. This purchasing agreement is an annual blanket purchase 
order for janitorial supplies and materials to maintain inventory in support of daily 
operations of facility maintenance within all City departments. 
 
The Central Stores operation is responsible for the procurement, storage and 
distribution of stock and non-stock items used by the City’s various departments and is 
the receiving and distribution point for all supplies purchased.  The majority of 
operations for the Central Stores division are accounted for in the Enterprise Funds. 
 
 
ATTACHMENTS  
A. Resolution 2017/** 
B. Bid Tabulation  

 



 

  

 
ATTACHMENT “A” 

 
RESOLUTION NO. 2017/** 

 
RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ANTIOCH 

APPROVING THE BIDS FOR CITY WIDE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES IN THE 
AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED $225,000.00 FOR THE PERIOD OF OCTOBER 1, 

2017 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2020 
 

WHEREAS, The City’s requires supplies for the ongoing janitorial services 
needed for city wide facility maintenance; and 

 
WHEREAS, on September 13, 2017 the City received bids for City Wide 

Janitorial Supplies (Bid 485-0913-18A); and 
 
WHEREAS, the City desires to purchase these supplies in the most cost 

effective manner. 
 

 THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the City Council of the City of Antioch 
hereby approves the purchasing agreement for City Wide Janitorial Supplies, with Cole 
Supply Company Inc., in the amount not to exceed $225,000.00 for the period of 
October 1, 2017 through June 30, 2020 and authorizes the City Manager to execute the 
purchase agreement.  
 
 

* * * * * * * * * * * 

 
 I HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing resolution was passed and adopted by 
the City Council of the City of Antioch at a regular meeting thereof, held on the 10th day 
of October, 2017 by the following vote: 
 
AYES: 
 
NOES:  
 
ABSENT:  
 
 
 
      _____________________________________ 
      ARNE SIMONSEN, CMC 

CITY CLERK OF THE CITY OF ANTIOCH 
 



ATTACHMENT “B” 
 

City Wide Janitorial Supplies 
Bid Number 485-0913-18A 

Bid Tabulation 

[Type text] 
 

Product Description Hammons 
Supply 

Cole Supply All 
American 

Poly 

Interboro 
Packaging 

Towels, paper, white, C-fold, 12 
pkg per case, 150 towels 
per/pkg, 2400 towels per case.  
Minimum weight 19 lbs. per 
case. EcoSoft #49300100% 
recycled or equal. 

$25.74 $14.95 No Bid No Bid 

Paper, toilet, 80 rls/cs, 500 2-
shts/roll, 4.5” x 4.5”, DublNature 
#59890 100% recycled or equal, 
minimum weight 52 lbs per 
case. 
 

$38.50 $26.95 No Bid No Bid 

Covers, toilet seat, ½ fold, 
200/pk, 20 pks/case, Health 
Guard or equal. 

$25.92 $21.80 No Bid No Bid 

Bleach, household in one gallon 
plastic jugs, 6 per case. 

$12.85 $11.95 No Bid No Bid 

Germicidal cleaner and 
deodorant concentrate, E-San 
64 or equal, in one-gal. plastic 
jugs, 6 per case 

$53.22 $27.68 No Bid No Bid 

Malodor counteractant, Chex 
odor kill, or equal, in one gal. 
plastic jugs, 4 per case 

$31.12 $35.89 No Bid No Bid 

Ultrasorb super fine, premium 
oil absorbent, 33-1/2 lb. sack. 

No Bid $5.40 No Bid No Bid 

Bags, trash, plastic, 36 x 58 in. 
1.5 mil 100/case, #3658 or 
equal. Minimum weight 22 
lb/case. Black color 
 

$23.38 $17.30 $16.89 $18.84 

Bags, trash, plastic, orange, 36” 
x 58”, 1.5 mil, 100 per case. No 
sub 

$30.76 $21.60 $20.84 $27.34 

Soap, hand, liquid type, 
Antibacterial, one gal. Plastic 
jug, 4 per case. 
 

$45.56 $24.50 No Bid No Bid 

Towels, paper, white, multi-fold, 
1pk/cs, 250 pr/pk, 3,000/cs, 
DublNature #48140 100% 
recycled or equal. Minimum 

$27.09 $14.95 No Bid No Bid 



ATTACHMENT “B” 
 

weight 22 lbs per case 

Light duty wipers, Kimberly 
Clark WypAll #05812, 12 
pk/case, 90/pkg, 
1080 per case. 

$49.57 $32.83 No Bid No Bid 

Bee, wasp, hornet killer, 12-oz 
aerosol can, long range, jet 
stream insecticide, Claire 
Golden Jet or equal. 

$5.38 $4.68 No Bid No Bid 

Insect Killer, 13oz. Aerosol can, 
Claire Bug Buster or equal. 

$59.28 $54.95 No Bid No Bid 

Cleaner, glass, aerosol, 19 oz. 
can 12/case, low v.o.c., Claire 
C-050, or sub 

$27.84 $21.70 No Bid No Bid 

Protectant, high gloss, aerosol, 
14 oz. 
12/case, Armor All or sub 

No Bid $38.66 No Bid No Bid 

Remove, vandalism, gelled 
formula,16 oz. aerosol can, 12 
cans per case, 
Claire CL880 or sub. 

No Bid $46.25 No Bid No Bid 

Pad 13” Blue Floor Scrub 5/CS $13.03 $6.76 No Bid No Bid 

Pad 13” Red Floor Buff 5/CS $13.03 $6.76 No Bid No Bid 

Toilet Tissue 9” Jumbo 1000’ 
Bleached 12/CS 

$21.60 $15.95 No Bid No Bid 

Roll Towel 600’ White, Optima 
Hard wound 12/CS 

No Bid $26.99 No Bid No Bid 

Mop, Large Blue 1” hub 12/CS $63.80 $91.08 No Bid No Bid 

Mop, Large Green 1” hub 12/CS No Bid $91.08 No Bid No Bid 

Dust Mope, Cotton Blue 5” X 
36” Untreated 12/CS 

$111.12 $101.56 No Bid No Bid 

GOJO 7255 Natural Orange 
Hand Cleaner with Pumice for 
dispenser 4/CS 

No Bid $57.67 No Bid No Bid 

Handle, Mop Fiberglass 64” 
Impact Speed Change 

No Bid $7.87 No Bid No Bid 

Seat Cover, ¼ fold  No Bid $27.25 No Bid No Bid 

Roll Towel 600’ 1.75 Core 
Kleenex 6/CS 

No Bid $34.50 No Bid No Bid 

Soap, Peach Foaming 4X1 
gallon Premium Hand Soap 

$30.00 $30.25 No Bid No Bid 

Glove, Small Powder Free 
Nitrile 100/bx 

$61.90 $39.95 No Bid  

Glove, Medium Powder Free 
Nitrile 100/bx 

$61.90 $39.95 No Bid  

Glove, Large Powder Free 
Nitrile 100/bx 

$61.90 $39.95   

Glove, X-Large Powder Free 
Nitrile 100/bx 

$61.90 $39.95 No Bid  



ATTACHMENT “B” 
 

Cleaner, Chlorinated Degreaser 
Spartan 3080 Pail 

No Bid $40.42 No Bid No Bid 

Odor Control, Consume Spartan 
3097 Pail 

No Bid $43.44 No Bid No Bid 

Dish Detergent, Blu Glo Spartan 
3111 4 X 1 gallon 

$41.48 $39.60 No Bid No Bid 

Quat Based RTU kitchen 
sanitizer, Sani-Tyze 12 quarts 
with 3 triggers per case 

No Bid $24.64 No Bid No Bid 

Neutral Disinfectant Cleaner, 
Spartan COG #103 Green 
Solutions 3513 4 X 2LTR 

No Bid $33.84 No Bid No Bid 

Bathroom Cleaner, NABC 
Concentrate #1, Spartan COG 4 
X 2LTR 

None Equal 
Submitted 

$71.67 No Bid No Bid 

Sanitizer Concentrate, SANI-
T10 Plus #22 Spartan COG 4 X 
2 LTR 

No Bid $42.48 No Bid No Bid 

Multi-purpose Cleaner, Tribase, 
Spartan COG #17 4 X 2LTR 

No Bid $39.54 No Bid No Bid 

Glass Cleaner, BioRenewables 
Spartan #18 4 X 2LTR 

No Bid $43.58 No Bid No Bid 

Degreaser, Surestep Spartan 
#23 4 X 2LTR 

No Bid $55.69 No Bid No Bid 

Aquasport Wood Floor Cleaner, 
Spartan Gallon 4 X 1 Gallon 

No Bid $29.42 No Bid No Bid 

Aquasport Wood Floor Cleaner, 
Spartan Pail 

No Bid $39.58 No Bid No Bid 

Baseboard cleaner/stripper, 
Aerosol 12/20oz 

No Bid $36.53 No Bid No Bid 

Detergent, all temp Sparclean 
Pail 

No Bid $70.32 No Bid No Bid 

Rinse Aid, high temp Sparclean 
Pail 

No Bid $73.72 No Bid No Bid 

Sanitizer, Sparclean Pail No Bid $30.60 No Bid No Bid 

Degreaser, Surestep Spartan 
Pail 

No Bid $66.04 No Bid No Bid 

Urinal screen, NABC Fresh 
Scent Spartan 

$16.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Stripper, Shineline Emulsifier 
Plus Spartan pail 

No Bid 52.07 No Bid No Bid 

Sealer, Shineline seal 24% 
Solids Spartan Pail 

No Bid $67.91 No Bid No Bid 

Wax, iShine 25% High Solids 
Floor Finish Spartan Pail 

No Bid $70.91 No Bid No Bid 

Mop, Finish Rayon Blend 
medium 1”hub  

$180.96 $48.95 No Bid No Bid 
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Agenda Item # 

STAFF REPORT TO THE CITY COUNCIL 

DATE: Regular Meeting of October 10, 2017 

TO: Honorable Mayor and Members of the City Council 

SUBMITTED BY: 

APPROVED BY: Nickie Mastay, Administrative Services Director 

SUBJECT: Board of Administrative Appeal Appointment for one (1) partial-term 
vacancy expiring March 2020 

RECOMMENDED ACTION 
It is recommended that the Mayor nominate and Council appoint by resolution one (1) 
member to the Board of Administrative Appeals for a partial-term vacancy which will 
expire March 2020. 

STRATEGIC PURPOSE 
Long Term Goal L:  City Administration.  Provide exemplary City administration. 
Strategy L-7: Coordinate City Boards and Commissions administrative requirements. 

FISCAL IMPACT 
There is no fiscal impact to the City as this position is voluntary. 

DISCUSSION 
The Board of Administrative Appeals consists of five members and one alternate to be 
appointed by the Mayor and confirmed by a majority of the Council. The alternate 
member shall serve a term of two years.  The Board hears appeals regarding 
administrative decisions by any official of the City dealing with Municipal Code 
interpretations. These administrative citations are typically issued by a Code 
Enforcement Officer, Police Officer, Business License Representative or Animal Control 
Officer.   

Three of the Board Members shall have experience in the building construction trades 
and/or training in the California Code of Regulations, or such training and experience 
necessary to hear appeals on Building, Housing, and Technical Codes.  All appointed 
members of the Board shall be Antioch residents.  Meetings are held the first Thursday 
of every month at 3:00 p.m. in the City Council Chambers; or on other dates as needed.  

� 

Christina Garcia, Deputy City Clerkíl2 
Arne Simonsen, CMC, City Clerk "'{) 



Antioch City Council Report  
October 10, 2017, Agenda Item #3  2 

The City of Antioch advertised to fill the vacancy in the usual manner.  The Clerk’s 
Office received two applications from the following residents to be considered for 
appointment to the partial-term vacancy: 
 

 Farideh Faraji 

 John Malcolm, Jr. 
 
The applicants were interviewed by Mayor Wright.   
 
 
ATTACHMENTS 
A. Resolution 
B. Applications 
 



ATTACHMENT A 

RESOLUTION NO. 2017/** 
 

RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ANTIOCH 
APPOINTING [INSERT NAME OF APPOINTEE AFTER APPOINTMENT] TO THE 

BOARD OF ADMINISTRATIVE APPEALS FOR THE ONE (1) PARTIAL-TERM 
VACANCY, ENDING IN MARCH 2020 

 
WHEREAS, there is currently one (1) partial-term vacancy on the Board of 

Administrative Appeals ending in March 2020; and 
 
WHEREAS, the City Clerk’s Office made announcement of the vacancy and 

solicited applications for the one (1) partial-term vacancy; and 
 
WHEREAS, Mayor Sean Wright considered two applications received and 

interviewed the interested applicants; and 
 
WHEREAS, Antioch Municipal Code Section 2-5.201 requires that the Mayor 

nominate candidates for membership on all boards and commissions and requires that 
the City Council approve, by a majority vote, the appointment of said nominee; and 

 
WHEREAS, Mayor Sean Wright has nominated [insert name of appointee after 

appointment] to the Board of Administrative Appeals. 
 
NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the City Council of the City of 

Antioch hereby approve the Mayor’s nomination of [insert name of appointee after 
appointment] and appoint him/her to serve on the Board of Administrative Appeals, for 
the one (1) partial-term vacancy, ending in March 2020. 

 
* * * * * * * * 

 
I HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing resolution was passed and adopted by 

the City Council of the City of Antioch at a regular meeting thereof, held on the 10th day 
of October, 2017, by the following vote: 
 
AYES:  
 
NOES:   
 
ABSTAIN:  
  
ABSENT:  
  
      _____________________________________ 

ARNE SIMONSEN, CMC 
CITY CLERK OF THE CITY OF ANTIOCH 



ATTACHMENT B













ATTACHMENT A 
 

RESOLUTION NO. 2017/** 
 

RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ANTIOCH 
APPOINTING [INSERT NAME OF APPOINTEE AFTER APPOINTMENT] TO THE 
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT COMMISSION FOR THE ONE (1) PARTIAL-TERM 

VACANCY, ENDING IN JUNE 2019 
 

WHEREAS, there is currently one (1) partial-term vacancy on the Economic 
Development Commission ending in June 2019; and 
 

WHEREAS, the City Clerk’s Office made announcement of the vacancy and 
solicited applications for the one (1) partial-term vacancy; and 
 

WHEREAS, Mayor Sean Wright considered six applications received and 
interviewed the interested applicants; and 
 

WHEREAS, Antioch Municipal Code Section 2-5.201 requires that the Mayor 
nominate candidates for membership on all boards and commissions and requires that 
the City Council approve, by a majority vote, the appointment of said nominee; and 
 

WHEREAS, Mayor Sean Wright has nominated [insert name of appointee after 
appointment) to the Economic Development Commission. 

 
NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the City Council of the City of 

Antioch hereby approve the Mayor’s nomination of [insert name of appointee after 
appointment] and appoint him/her to serve on the Economic Development Commission, 
for the one (1) partial-term vacancy, ending in June 2019. 

 
 

* * * * * * * * 

I HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing resolution was passed and adopted by 
the City Council of the City of Antioch at a regular meeting thereof, held on the 10th day 
of October, 2017, by the following vote: 
 
AYES:  
 
NOES:   
 
ABSTAIN:  
  
ABSENT:  
  
      _____________________________________ 

ARNE SIMONSEN, CMC 
CITY CLERK OF THE CITY OF ANTIOCH 
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